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Teaching and Learning During
the Time of Turbulence:
Faculty and Residents
Perspective
Sir,

The  COVID-19  pandemic  disrupted  the  medical  education
globally,  forcing  rapid  adaptation  to  virtual  learning  (VL).
While  VL  ensures  educational  continuity  during  crises,  it
presents  significant  challenges,  especially  in  medical  fields
that rely on hands-on training and clinical exposure.1 VL acts as
a  time-effective  substitute  for  face-to-face  teaching  but,  its
implication is always challenging, and its success depends on
the quality of resources, faculty readiness, and technical exper-
tise.2,3

This study aimed to evaluate the adaptability of faculty and resi-
dents to VL during the pandemic and to highlight the key chal-
lenges they faced. It was conducted at The Aga Khan University
Hospital over six months, the study surveyed 81 participants,
including both faculty and residents across various specialities.
A self-designed questionnaire based on AMEE Guide 87 was
used, and responses were analysed using SPSS version 20. The
results revealed that 45.4% of residents and 35.4% of faculty
participants were male. Most participants (39.5%) fell within
the 31-40 age group. Notably, 46.9% of the respondents had
previous online learning experience. Zoom and Google Meet
were the most used platforms.

The  key  barriers  identified  were  lack  of  technological  skills
(55.6% agreed), technical issues such as poor bandwidth and
device malfunction, and difficulties in adapting to the time-con-
suming nature of VL. Furthermore, a lack of human interaction
and challenges in assessing learning outcomes were significant
concerns, with 53.1% of participants agreeing that VL compli-
cates  student  assessment.  Despite  these  challenges,  many
participants recognised the potential of VL. Over half of them
believed  that  VL  should  continue  as  a  regular  teaching
modality, citing its flexibility and cost-saving benefits. More-
over,  VL  was  seen  as  an  effective  way  to  promote  social
distancing  while  maintaining  educational  standards.  Our
findings suggest that VL, despite challenging, offers substantial
opportunities  for  improving  medical  education.  Addressing
technical issues, enhancing faculty and student training, and
refining VL platforms will be critical for its sustained success.
However, the limited scope of our study focused on a single

centre suggests that further research is needed to assess the
generalisability of these findings across broader educational
contexts.4

In conclusion, the pandemic has highlighted both the limita-
tions and potential of VL. Moreover, investing in technological
infrastructure and training will be crucial for integrating VL into
mainstream medical education.
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