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An Archetypal Variant of
Peripheral Adenomatoid Odon-
togenic Tumour
Sir,

A 12-year boy presented with the chief complaint of an asympto-
matic slowly growing swelling on the attached gingiva of the
labial surface of left maxillary central incisors for one year. On
intra-oral examination, a well-defined solitary nodular swelling
of 0.7×0.5 cm was noted on the attached gingiva of the labial
surface of  maxillary left  lateral  incisors,  extending from the
mesial aspect of the central incisor to the mesial aspect of the
lateral incisor (Figure 1). On palpation, the swelling was non--
tender, smooth surfaced, and of firm consistency. The case was
provisionally diagnosed as fibrous epulis with differential diag-
nosis of other reactive lesions of the gingiva, such as peripheral
ossifying fibroma. The intra-oral periapical radiograph revealed
a bony erosion with respect to the inter-dental area between the
central and lateral incisors, beginning at the level of middle-
third, and extending upto the apical-third of radicular portion of
lateral  incisor.  Subsequently,  an  excisional  biopsy  was
performed and specimen was sent for histopathological exami-
nation. The histopathology revealed fibrous capsule with prolif-
erating spindle and cuboidal cells arranged in duct-like struc-
tures and rosettes. The scattered duct-like structures showed
lumen  of  varying  sizes,  and  were  lined  by  single  layer  of
cuboidal to columnar epithelial cells with nuclei polarised away
from the lumen. Stellate reticulum-like spindle cells were seen
between the duct- like structures (Figure 2). The stroma was
loose with irregular to round calcified bodies seen in- between. A
diagnosis  of  peripheral  adenomatoid  odontogenic  tumour
(PAOT) was made.

Figure 1: Solitary well-defined swelling on the attached gingiva.

PAOT is one of the rarest odontogenic tumours constituting only
about 3% of all odontogenic tumours.1 The rarity of the lesion
and its ambiguous presentation makes it a diagnostically chal-
lenging  entity.  The  clinical  presentation  mimicking  reactive
lesions of the gingiva along with minimal bony changes in the

radiograph can easily  misguide the diagnosis.  PAOT usually
manifests  in  younger  age group with  a  female  predilection,
favouring maxillary anterior region. 2 The radiographic evalua-
tion  will  not  yield  any  striking  bony  changes  and  the  histo-
pathology is the ultimate diagnostic part that reveals true micro-
scopic nature of the lesion.3

Figure 2: High-power view of one of the duct-like structures, lined by
cuboidal to columnar cells with polarised nuclei. Stellate reticulum like
spindle cells are seen between the duct-like structures. (H&E, ×200).

 Due to its clinical resemblance, PAOT can easily be mistaken for
innocent reactive lesions of the gingiva, so it is recommended to
go for histological evaluation for the ultimate diagnosis. Conser-
vative surgical excision with adequate margins is the treatment
modality, which was done in the present case; and overall prog-
nosis is excellent. The recurrent cases were only two till date.4
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