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INTRODUCTION

Papillary carcinoma accounts for less than 2% of breast
carcinomas. Encapsulated papillary carcinoma (EPC) is
regarded as a rare variant of papillary carcinoma.1 It
usually occurs in old women. Clinically, it appears as a
circumscribed round mass, variably associated with
nipple discharge.2 Radiography typically demonstrates a
mass within a cystically dilated space. Gross examination
usually reveals a friable mass inside a cystic cavity. Micro-
scopically, EPCs are surrounded by fibrous capsule with
papillary proliferation of neoplastic epithelial cells of low
to intermediate grade supported by fibrovascular stalks
with absent myoepithelial cell layer within the papillae
and around the periphery.2 Prognosis is usually
favourable; however, a subset of these tumors shows
high grade cytonuclear features, high mitotic index,
focal micropapillary areas or extracellular mucin which
renders them as aggressive tumors with potential for
recurrence and metastasis.3-5

We present a case of 22-year female with swelling in the
right breast upper outer quadrant for the last seven months. 

CASE REPORT

A 22-year female presented with tender swelling in right
breast upper outer quadrant for a period of seven months.

The swelling was associated with fever, bodyache and
palpable tender lymph nodes in the ipsilateral lower
axilla. Ultrasound breast revealed a solid mass with
cystic component.

The specimen received was coded as "Right breast,
wide local excision with axillary lymph node dissection".
It was a nodular non-skin covered fibroadipose tissue
measuring 8.5 x 8 x 6.5 cm with attached irregular piece
of adipose tissue measuring 9 x 3.5 cm (Figure 1). Cut
surface of the nodule revealed an encapsulated cystic
friable lesion measuring 6 x 6 cm. It had a tan to pale
yellow appearance. Grossly, it was 0.2 cm from the outer
painted fat. A total of 11 lymph nodes were recovered
from the attached adipose tissue.

Microscopy showed an encapsulated lesion composed
of large nests and aggregates of cells supported by
fibro-vascular stalks. The cells were moderately
pleomorphic with vesicular nuclei, conspicuous   nucleoli
and scant to moderate eosinophilic cytoplasm. Brisk
mitotic activity (up to 33 mitoses/10 HPF), necrosis and
fibrosis were also seen (Figure 2). The tumor was
graded as grade III (tubule, 3; pleomorphic, 3; mitotic
count, 3) according to Modified Bloom and Richardson
grading system. Immunostaining for smooth muscle
actin (SMA) showed loss of myoepithelial cells within the
lesion and at the periphery. Receptor status showed
weak estrogen receptor positivity; whereas, progesterone
receptor and HER-2 neu were negative. All lymph nodes
were negative. Based on all these combined features,
this was diagnosed as high grade EPC of right breast. A
comment was given regarding stage that it was
inappropriate to stage encapsulated papillary breast
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carcinoma with high grade features as per current WHO
staging of breast carcinomas. Patient received further
treatment as chemo-radiation and after a follow-up of
one and a half year, patient was disease-free.2

DISCUSSION

Previous studies have shown that 2.5 to 14% of pure
EPCs are high grade. Several recent studies have
reidentified such tumors with tendency to develop local
stromal/muscle infiltration and metastasis.5-7 Though
EPCs have a thick capsule, but it is a result of reactive
process rather than the ducts' basement membrane
expansion.6 Therefore, some authors consider it as a
non-conventional invasive form of breast carcinoma.8

Our case was a pure encapsulated one, but had high
nuclear grade, pleomorphism and brisk mitotic index
which do not justify to stage it as Tis as per WHO
guidelines. There is another recent study in which 12
such tumors were identified, out of which 10 had
outcome data. One of these patients developed
recurrence and distant metastasis that ended in cancer-
related death of the patient and seven cases had follow-

up of only less than two years. Sixty-eight percent of
these cases were hormone receptor negative and two
cases even showed necrotic foci. Few cases were
positive for other markers, namely, cytokeratin 5/6 and
EGFR.4,9 In another study by Lefkowitz et al. on 77
cases, three patients with pure EPC without stromal
invasion developed metastasis.10

Hence, classification, staging and management of this
subset of EPCs with aggressive features should be
revisited in order to justify the aggressiveness of such
tumors at clinical level. EPC is a heterogeneous tumor
with low grade tumors at one end and high grade with
aggressive features at the other.11 We recommend
characterisation of high grade EPCs and suggest further
studies to understand the nature and behaviour of such
tumors.
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Figure 1: Encapsulated circumscribed tumor with gross papillary
configuration and surrounding breast tissue.

Figure 2: (A) Papillary lesion surrounded by fibrous capsule (H&E stain 2x).
(B & C) Papillary tumor with prominent fibrovascular cores (H&E stain 4x & 10x).
(D) Moderately atypical nuclei with frequent mitotic figures (H&E stain 40x).
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